1846 ATR LAWS AND TREATIES OF THE WORLD

ANALYSIS

1. Short Title
Title 2. Duration of licences

1960, No. 51

An Act to amend the Air Services Licensing Act 1951
[25 October 1960

BE IT ENACTED by the General Assembly of New Zealand
in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as
follows:

1. Short Title—This Act may be cited as the Air Services
Licensing Amendment Act 1960, and shall be read together
with and deemed part of the Air Services Licensing Act 1951%
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act).

2. Duration of licences—(1) Section 25 of the principal
Act is hereby amended by omitting the words “five years”,
and substituting the words “seven years”.

(2) Subsection (8) of section 27 of the principal Act (as
substituted by section 6 of the Air Services Licensing Amend-
ment Act 1958) is hereby amended by omitting the words
“five years”, and substituting the words “seven years”.

#1957 Reprint, Vol. 1, p. 177
Amendment: 1958, No. 44




